TO BE PUBLISHED IN THE GAZETTE OF INDIA, PART-Il, SECTION 3,
SUB-SECTION (i)-EXTRAORDINARY

GOVERNMENT OF INDIA
MINISTRY OF LABOUR

New Delhi, Friday, October 18, 2002.

NOTIFICATION

G.S.R.713 (E). - In exercise of the powers conferred by section 43 of the Emigration
Act, 1983 (31 of 1983), the Central Government hereby makes the following rules
further to amend the Emigration Rules, 1983, namely:-

1. (1) These rules may be called the Emigration (Amendment) Rules, 2002.
(2) They shall come into force with effect from 1st November, 2002.
2. In the Emigration Rules, 1983,

(@) In rule 7, in clause (i), for the words “five hundred rupee" the words "two
thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

(b) In Rule 9A, for the words "five hundred rupees" the words "two thousand
rupees” shall be substituted.

(c) In rule 11, after sub-rule (2) the following shall be inserted, namely:-

"(3) The application under rules (1) and (2) above shall be accompanied by bank
draft of rupees two thousand payable in favour of the Pay and Accounts Officer,
Ministry of Labour (Main Secretariat), New Delhi, towards the application fee".

(d) In sub-rule (1) of rule 15, after the words "or through the employer" and before
the words "concerned and", the words "including Indian employers permitted under
rule 11 (2)" shall be inserted.

(e) In clause (g) of sub-rule (1) of rule 15, for the words " rupees one hundred”, the
words "rupees two hundred" shall be substituted.

(f) After rule 15, the following rule shall be inserted namely:-

"15A. All applications from the persons, individually or through recruiting agents or
through other permitted agents, who intend to go abroad on short term non-
employment visit and requiring suspension of emigration check requirements for a
limited period (emigration suspension), shall be accompanied by a demand draft of
rupees one hundred drawn in favour of the Protector General of Emigrants as fee in
respect of each applicant".

(9) In sub-rule (1), of rule 18, for the words: "rupees one hundred", the words "
rupees two hundred" shall be substituted.

(K.CHANDRAMOULI)
JOINT SECRETARY/ PROTECTOR GENERAL OF EMIGRANTS
(F.NO.S.11012/1/2001-Emig.)

NOTE: The Principal Emigration Rules were published in Part Il Section 3, sub-
section(ii) of the Gazette of India (Extraordinary) vide S.0/941 (E) dated 30th



December, 1983, and subsequently amended vide (1) S.0.665(E) dated 10th
September, 1986, (2) GSR 111(E) dated 24th February, 1987, (3) GSR 375 (E)
dated 23rd March, 1989, (4) S.0.111(E) dated 8th February, 1996, (5) S.0.159(E)
dated 28th February, 1996 and (6) S.0.526(E) dated 22nd July, 1996.

To

The Manager,

Government of India Press,
Mayapuri Ring Road,

New Delhi.



